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Mark 9: 33-35  -  Teach them that God’s way to true greatness of mind and heart, leading to                   
                                     godly character, is to be a servant. 
 
Colossians 3: 21-24 – Fathers should not provoke their children lest they become discouraged. 
Rather you should teach them in family worship this great and abiding principle of truth.  
Whatever they do should do, they should do it heartily unto the Lord and not to men, know that 
from the Lord they will receive the inheritance; for they serve the Lord Christ.   
 
Galatians 5: 13 – “For you have been called to liberty; only do not use liberty as an opportunity 
for the flesh, but through love serve one another.”  “For all the law is fulfilled in one word, even 
in this: ‘You shall love your neighbor as yourself.” 
 
John 13: 1-16 – “Surely a servant is not greater than his master; nor is he who is sent greater 
than he who sent him.”  “If you know these things, blessed are you if you do them.” 
 
Matthew 10: 24 and 25 – “A disciple is not above his teacher, nor a servant above his master.”  
“It is enough for a disciple that he be like his teacher, and a servant like his master.” 
 
Colossians 2: 6 – “As therefore you have received Christ Jesus the Lord, so walk in Him, rooted 
and built up in Him and established in the faith, as you have been taught, abounding in it with 
thanksgiving.”   
 
Jeremiah Burroughs Quote:  “Walking with God causes the soul to follow God more as He 
reveals Himself.  The soul that walks with God, as God reveals Himself unto it more and more, 
follows God more and more and still seeks to glorify God more and more.  That’s walking!  There 
is a progress in the ways of godliness where there is a walking.  When the soul is first led by the 
hand of Jesus Christ to God and walks with Him, ‘tis sweet and comfortable!  But still, as God 
reveals Himself more and more to the soul, the soul still grows up in godliness more and more, 
and still is more holy and more gracious, and honors God more in the life than it had formerly 
done.  It gets nearer and nearer to heaven every day; this is to walk with God.” – A Treatise on 
Earthly-Mindedness, P. 200, 201   
 
Psalm 63: 8 – Jeremiah Burroughs - 
“There is a notable Scripture in Psalm 63: 8 where David says, ‘My soul follows hard after Thee, 
O Lord.”  “Thy right hand upholds me.”  “A poor child who walks with his father may be weak 
and cannot go as fast as he desires, but the father puts forth his hand, and takes hold of him, and 
so upholds and strengthens the child, and the child follows hard after the father.  So it is here.  
“O Lord, They right hand upholds me.”  “If it did not uphold me, I could not walk.”  “But Thy 
right hand upholds me, and then my soul follows hard after Thee, and so increases in godliness 
more and more.  Page 201 


