
GRACE COMMUNITY BIBLE FELLOWSHIP

THANKSGIVING AND WORSHIP SERVICE

September 2, 2020

6:45 p.m. Songs of Thanksgiving and Worship
7:00 p.m Bible Study

Scripture Reading: Romans 14:1-19

Songs of Praise, Worship and Thanksgiving

Study: Romans 14:7-19

Why Do You Judge Your Brother?

The Lord’s Supper
Prayer

If you have questions or comments about today’s sermon, please feel free to
contact me at 758-4400.

Jim Flaherty, pastor
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Scripture References   

Galatians 4:8 However at that time, when you did not know God, you
were slaves to those which by nature are no gods. 9 But now that you
have come to know God, or rather to be known by God, how is it that
you turn back again to the weak and worthless elemental things, to
which you desire to be enslaved all over again? 10 You observe days
and months and seasons and years. 11 I fear for you, that perhaps I
have labored over you in vain.

Colossians 2:15 When He had disarmed the rulers and authorities, He
made a public display of them, having triumphed over them through
Him. 16 Therefore no one is to act as your judge in regard to food or
drink or in respect to a festival or a new moon or a Sabbath day - 17
things which are a mere shadow of what is to come; but the substance
belongs to Christ. 

Acts 2:32 This Jesus God raised up again, to which we are all
witnesses. 33 Therefore having been exalted to the right hand of God,
and having received from the Father the promise of the Holy Spirit,
He has poured forth this which you both see and hear. . . . 36
Therefore let all the house of Israel know for certain that God has
made Him both Lord and Christ - this Jesus whom you crucified.”

Philippians 2:8 Being found in appearance as a man, He humbled
Himself by becoming obedient to the point of death, even death on a
cross. 9 For this reason also, God highly exalted Him, and bestowed
on Him the name which is above every name, 10 so that at the name
of Jesus EVERY KNEE WILL BOW, of those who are in heaven and
on earth and under the earth, 11 and that every tongue will confess
that Jesus Christ is Lord, to the glory of God the Father.

Luke 24:26 Was it not necessary for the Christ to suffer these things
and to enter into His glory?”

Matt. 28:18 And Jesus came up and spoke to them, saying, “All
authority has been given to Me in heaven and on earth. 



Leviticus 23:5 In the first month, on the 14th day of the month at
twilight is the LORD’S Passover. 6 Then on the 15th day of the same
month there is the Feast of Unleavened Bread to the LORD; for 7
days you shall eat unleavened bread. 7 On the first day you shall have
a holy convocation; you shall not do any laborious work. 8 But for 7
days you shall present an offering by fire to the LORD. On the 7th
day is a holy convocation; you shall not do any laborious work.’”

1 Corinthians 3:12 Now if any man builds on the foundation with
gold, silver, precious stones, wood, hay, straw, 13 each man’s work
will become evident; for the day will show it because it is to be
revealed with fire, and the fire itself will test the quality of each
man’s work. 14 If any man’s work which he has built on it remains,
he will receive a reward. 15 If any man’s work is burned up, he will
suffer loss; but he himself will be saved, yet so as through fire.

2 Corinthians 5:10 For we must all appear before the judgment seat of
Christ, so that each one may be recompensed for his deeds in the
body, according to what he has done, whether good or bad.

Matthew 7:1 “Do not judge so that you will not be judged. 2 For in
the way you judge, you will be judged; and by your standard of
measure, it will be measured to you. 3 Why do you look at the speck
that is in your brother’s eye, but do not notice the log that is in your
own eye? 4 Or how can you say to your brother, ‘Let me take the
speck out of your eye,’ and behold, the log is in your own eye? 5 You
hypocrite, first take the log out of your own eye, and then you will see
clearly to take the speck out of your brother’s eye.

1 Corinthians 5:9 I wrote you in my letter not to associate with
immoral people; 10 I did not at all mean with the immoral people of
this world, or with the covetous and swindlers, or with idolaters, for
then you would have to go out of the world. 11 But actually, I wrote
to you not to associate with any so-called brother if he is an immoral
person, or covetous, or an idolater, or a reviler, or a drunkard, or a
swindler--not even to eat with such a one. 12 For what have I to do
with judging outsiders? Do you not judge those who are within the
church? 13 But those who are outside, God judges. REMOVE THE
WICKED MAN FROM AMONG YOURSELVES.

1 Timothy 4:4  For everything created by God is good, and nothing is
to be rejected if it is received with gratitude; 

Titus 1:15 To the pure, all things are pure; but to those who are
defiled and unbelieving, nothing is pure, but both their mind and their
conscience are defiled.

Matthew 15:11 It is not what enters into the mouth that defiles the
man, but what proceeds out of the mouth, this defiles the man.”

Mark 7:18 And He said to them, “Are you so lacking in
understanding also? Do you not understand that whatever goes into
the man from outside cannot defile him, 19 because it does not go
into his heart, but into his stomach, and is eliminated?” (Thus He
declared all foods clean.)

John 13:34 A new commandment I give to you, that you love one
another, even as I have loved you, that you also love one another. 35
By this all men will know that you are My disciples, if you have love
for one another.”

John 15:12 “This is My commandment, that you love one another,
just as I have loved you. 13 Greater love has no one than this, that one
lay down his life for his friends. 14 You are My friends if you do
what I command you.”

1 John 3:23 This is His commandment, that we believe in the name of
His Son Jesus Christ, and love one another, just as He commanded us.
24 The one who keeps His commandments abides in Him, and He in
him. We know by this that He abides in us, by the Spirit whom He
has given us.

1 John 4:7 Beloved, let us love one another, for love is from God; and
everyone who loves is born of God and knows God. 8 The one who
does not love does not know God, for God is love.


